


We produced 3 National reports, that 
present concrete skill needs and gaps in 
qualifications frameworks in the T&C 
industries (mainly in the manufacture of 
clothing, home textile and technical 
textile) and WBL good practices from 
each country. 
You can access now the detailed final 
global report with all the main findings 
about the qualification needs and WBL 
good practices of the T&C sector in UE: 

We also produced a Booklet on key 
findings on qualification needs and WBL 
good practices for the textile and clothing 
sector: 

We developed a new and attractive 
Clothing Technician profile and 
Qualification! 
The development of the new Clothing 
Technician Profile and Qualification is 
based on the real analysis of the needs of 
the companies/job market and the 
analysis of the existing professional 
profiles in the area of clothing in 
Portugal, Spain and Romania.  
The partnership defined that the profile 
would be level 4 in EU, PT, ES, RO and 
that each country would adopt it to its 
national system. You can now access the 
convention for the EU profile, with 
detailed hours and ECVET points below: 
 

 

 

Clothing Technician Profile and 
Qualification  

Matrix ECVET: 
Will follows the descriptors (knowledge, 
skills, responsibility, autonomy) defining 
levels in the EQF. It will present precise 
guidelines with the profile match in 
Portugal, Spain and Romania. It will target 
all VET providers, companies, trainees and 
national regulatory authorities of 
qualifications. 
Tutorial guide for mobility: 
Will consist of a description of the mobility 
purposes with the main documents used 
for recognizing the mobility in Europe. It 
will target all VET providers, trainees, 
companies, trade unions, sectors 
associations and other entities that work 
or help with mobility process.  

Our work in progress... 

Network sessions 
completed! 

www.bit.ly/TCQprofile 

To undertake the Clothing Technician 
Profile and Qualification in each partner 
country, partners worked intensively 
together. 

PT, ES, RO promoted a set of Network 
sessions with companies and VET 
providers between June and September 
2019. In total it involved 5 
Representatives from the  national 
authorities, 22 Representatives of the 
textile and clothing companies and 33 
VET experts. 

Roadmap on Qualification Needs 
and WBL Good Practices 

www.bit.ly/cstmkeyfindings 

www.bit.ly/cstmroadmap 

www.clothingtechnician.eu 

http://bit.ly/TCQprofile
http://bit.ly/cstmkeyfindings
http://bit.ly/cstmroadmap

